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Description

Short Essay on Save Water (200 Words)

Water is the most important thing on the planet. We can’t think of the whole biodiversity without water.
This is the biggest gift from Mother Nature. The entire earth is 71% of the surface by water. But only
2.5% is clean and safe water.

There are so many reasons behind lacking safe water. After that much huge water, still, now lots of
regions are having a water problem. Our country also has lots of problems with safe water. There are
some reasons that we should be careful about it.

We will be able to save water in this way. Do you know, rainwater is really good and clean? We can
collect and store rainwater and drink them after boiling properly. There are lots more ways that could
be helpful to save more water. Some parts of India are facing a really big problem with the water crisis.

We should be aware of this; because we need to have a system that will ensure proper water for our
future generation. Year after year, the situation is being really tough. Lots of countries are being drier
than the past and facing huge water lacking.  

Essay on How to Save Water (300 Words)



How to Save Water Essay in 300 Words

Introduction: Water is a really important element that we get from Mother Nature. We can say, that’s a
blessing for us. 71% of the entire earth is full of water. But can you imagine, after this amount of water
there is still lacking safe water?

Lots of regions in the world are facing a brutal water crisis. And overall, the human is responsible for
this. We can fix the problem if we want. But day by day, the problem is being really big. Sometimes
water becomes a blessing and sometimes it becomes a curse.

Water pollution is responsible for the few biggest health issues in the world. Today here I am going to
talk about a few really important methods that will be helpful for you if you want to save water.  

How to Save Water: There are hundreds of little tips and tricks you might follow to save some water.
Here I am going to share some daily tips that you can do easily. First of all, I suggest everyone check
your toilet for a leak. Maybe we are wasting hundreds of gallons of water daily without even knowing.

You can easily check for a leak by color water. If you find any leak then fix it as soon as possible. This
type of leak is very common and it happens everywhere, so you better do a check. Start taking a
shorter shower than before. It might save some water.

I am saying to reduce using water, you just need to be a little careful while bathing. We waste a huge
amount of water. From your nearest hardware shop buy water-saving showerhead.  This head will
reduce the water flow, but it will be the same refreshing and clean. You will have the exact same
bathing experience but will save water together.  

Conclusion: So it’s not that hard to save some water. We all can do it.    

Save Water Essay (400 Words)
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Essay on Save Water in 400 Words

Introduction: Right after air, water is the most important natural element that we need to survive. Can
you imagine a single day without having water? I can’t. the whole living things like humans, animals,
trees, plants, everything needs water to survive.

So we can realize the importance of water from this. But water is not available everywhere. Some
places are really dry and being dryer day by day. In another hand, some are wasting water. So we all
should need to be aware of water-saving.

It’s really important for the next generation. If we don’t be aware of saving water, we will face a
shortage in the near future. Maybe our next generation will be the victim. So we all need to be aware of
that to make the world better for everyone.  

Why Should We Save Water?: There are so many reasons that should we save water. Water is 71%
of the total surface of the world. That means there are lots of waters everywhere. But why still there are
lacking water? Actually, there is only 2.5% of clean water.

That’s mean a huge amount of water is not safe for us to drink or use. Now some countries are having
a really bad impact because of the water crisis. They don’t have proper water for their daily life. We all
want to get rid of this problem. But some of us think that, can I change the whole situation?

Yes, you can do it. When everyone will think as like you, the situation will change. So the reason
behind saving water is to make sure to have enough clean safe water for the rest of the world and next
generation. We need to find a proper way that will ensure safe water for a decade.  

How to Save Water?: There are so many simple tips and tricks that you can follow in your daily life if
you want to save water. I am mentioning a few of them. Never forget to open your water tap.
Sometimes we go to the washroom and keep the water tap open, and forget to close it.

Sometimes the very low amount of water keeps falling and we don’t care about it. But it wastes a huge
amount in hours of falling. This is a very basic thing. If you are having water leaking issue on your



water tap, fix it as soon as possible.  

Conclusion: So water saving is not that hard. We can save huge water with our little efforts.    

Save Water Essay in 500 Words

Essay on Save Water in 500 Words

Introduction: Water is a very important element for every living thing on this planet. We can’t survive
without having water. 70% of the entire world is covered with water. But only 1% is accessible to us
and really fewer amounts are safe and clean to use.

That’s why the whole world is concerned about saving water. Lots of regions are having a massive
water crisis. They are fighting with so many problems. Maybe you are having enough water for your
daily life and you are not concern about it.

But you should, because we need to ensure a better future for the next generation. If we stop wasting
water, maybe they won’t face any water shortage in their time. That’s why we need to be aware and
careful about this issue. In this essay, we will discuss the importance of clean water and a few ways to
save water.  

Importance of Clean Water: Water is a fundamental need for every human in the world. We need
around 20 liters water a day to drinking, cooking, cleaning you. So it’s a really important element. But
can you imagine doing all this stuff with dirty water?

No, it’s not possible. We can face really fatal health issues. People always need to ensure water is
clean and safe before drinking. That’s why clean water is really important. Clean water is important for
your body. It helps to prevent diseases.



But if the water is dirty itself, then it can create disease own. There are some fatal diseases likecholera,
typhoid, and hepatitis A could happen with you because of having dirty water.  

Top Ways to Save Water: There are so many interesting ways to save water. I will share a few of
them with you. I hope you will like these. And implementing these tips, you can save a massive amount
of water. We all have a water line in our kitchen, toilet, washroom, and other places.

First of all, take time and check the whole system and find leaks. Find out that, if anywhere is leaking
water. Sometimes the water tap or showerhead leaks and waste so much water. You should fix that
first of all. When you are brushing your teeth standing in front of the basin, you need to turn off the
water tap.

Or the best way is to collect water in a mug and use it. This way saves huge water. The kitchen is a
really crucial plane in a home and lots of water is important there. We cook food with water. So water is
a fundamental element in the kitchen.

But have you ever thought to save water in the kitchen? If you are not, it’s time to think. Suppose,
when you are washing your dishes by hand, don’t keep the tap open. Use aerators in your tap that will
lower the water flow and make the wastage less.  

Conclusion: There are lots of people in the world who are not having safe water to drink. The statistic
is really shocking. Especially people from Africa, India, and Nepal are having serious water problems
with them. So the whole world should be concerned about this. If everyone starts saving water and
makes another one aware of this, then we will be able to save water for the next generation.

Long Essay on Save Water (600 Words)

Essay on Save Water in 600 Words

Introduction: Save water has been a really important issue in the present world. We all know that right



after air, water is the most important thing to survive on this planet. Maybe you are having enough
water supplies in your place to keep going to your regular life.

But there are still billions of people in the entire world who are facing a huge water crisis. We should be
concerned about our future generation. If we keep wasting water, maybe they have to face a huge
water shortage in their time. That’s why it’s important to know more about saving water. If we all try and
start saving water it will be easier.  

Importance of Water: As I said before, any living things can’t survive without having water. Humans,
animals, trees, plants, insects, and fishes everything needs enough water to survive. We need not only
for drinking but also it keeps continue our daily works like washing clothes, bathing, cooking, cleaning
several things.

There is lots of importance of water that is not possible to describe. But I will try to show a few of them
and let you understand how much water is important for all of us. Water helps to protect our hearts. It’s
the most important element in our body that keeps the blood circulation and heart better.

But we need to ensure drinking clean and safe water for that. Drinking water can save your money
instead of drinking soft drinks. Most of the time waters are free. So that will save your money of course.
You can lose weight drinking enough water, and it is proved.

If you drink a lot of water it will increase your metabolic rate and that burns fat and help to lose your
weight. Drinking water is a good thing for the brain as well. All of these were health issues, instead of
health issues, there are still lots of importance of water.

We need water to do a bath and wash our clothes. It’s not possible to wash clothes without water.
Overall, the importance of water is indescribable.   How to Save Water? There are so many ways to
save water. We should limit using water. When we use it, we need to be careful.

We all have a water pipeline in our house, I suggest everyone check their lines and find if there any
leakage. You need to fix the leak if you find any. Use the showerhead and head for a water tap, that
reduces water flow and minimizes the wastage.  

How to Prevent Water Pollution?: Water pollution is one of the biggest reasons for water wasting.
People are making water polluted and making it unable to use it for mankind. There are lots of reasons
for water pollution. We all should need to be aware of these and prevent water pollution.

I think the biggest reason is the big mills and factories. They are throwing their chemical dust in the
rivers and canals. The water is being poisonous and the fishes are going to die. Sometimes people are
eating these fishes and having serious health injuries.  

A farmer contaminates the water including chemical medicine in their fields. Rainwater brings that to
the canals and river. They use medicine to kill insect but ultimately that kills fishes and make the water
polluted. If we can stop water pollution, we will get lots of water sources and that will help us to fight
against water shortage.  
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Conclusion: If we all don’t get aware of the issue, it won’t be possible to make it real. We can save
water together and make this world a better place for our future generation.
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